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SUMMARY 

Following the evaluation of the site in 2009, The Dyfed Archaeological Trust (DAT) 

undertook a larger excavation at St Bride’s Haven, Pembrokeshire (NGR SM 8021 

1094) for four weeks from March 2010 and April 2011. Over 35 graves were 

excavated. Bone preservation was generally poor; some graves contained no 

bone, others only skull fragments and teeth. Some burials, however, were better 

preserved. It is hoped that the material recovered will provide further C14 dating 

evidence, and potentially material for stable isotope analysis. The cemetery 

seemed different in character to other cemetery sites excavated recently in the 

region, and following specialist analyses of the human skeletal material and the 

character of the burials, the results will provide useful information for comparison 

with other sites investigated as part of the Pembrokeshire Early Medieval 

Cemeteries Project. Further analysis will also provide information about the 

history of St Bride’s Haven that could form the basis of further public outreach. 

The excavation was undertaken by staff from DAT and volunteers from the local 

community. The project was funded with grant aid from Cadw and PLANED and 

with the participation of the PCNPA archaeologist. 
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INTRODUCTION 

Project background 

The site lies at NGR SM 8021 1094 within the Pembrokeshire Coast National Park, 
close to the popular beach of St Bride’s Haven.  It is one of approximately 38 
known or possible early medieval cemetery sites in Pembrokeshire.  

In 2009, Dyfed Archaeological Trust was grant aided by Cadw and Pembrokeshire 
Coast National Park Authority (PCNPA) to undertake an archaeological evaluation 
of the site to clarify its nature, extent and survival. The main goal of the project 
was to obtain information on the extent, complexity and significance of the 
archaeological resource that might require consideration within a management 
plan for the site. 

Various options for mitigating the impacts of coastal erosion on the site were 
identified, with the preferred option being to excavate the cemetery to obtain as 
much information about it as possible in advance of its eventual destruction. 

The availability of Cadw contingency funding towards the end of the 2010/2011 
financial year offered the opportunity to undertake a three week excavation of the 
site, with a further week added from funding from the 2011 financial year.  

 

Project objectives 

The excavation aimed to excavate all the features revealed on the site through a 
process of ‘preservation by record’, thereby solving the problem of loss of cultural 
material to erosion for several decades, if not centuries.  

In addition to the archaeological objectives, community engagement and 
involvement was an important aspect of the project. Local volunteers undertook 
the majority of excavation, providing a rare opportunity to gain archaeological 
experience. 

From the previous excavation it was recognized that the location of the site and 
the popularity of St Bride’s Haven as a place to access the coastal path, resulted 
in a steady stream of visitors to the excavation. The opportunity to effectively 
engage with the public was consequently identified as a specific part of any future 
excavation at the site. With funding from PLANED it was possible to include a 
team member specifically dedicated to ‘public engagement’ during the excavation. 

 

Site description 

St Bride’s Haven is a small, sheltered north-facing inlet on St. Bride’s Bay (Figure 
2 and 3; Plate 1; Photo 1). To the south of the inlet is a low-lying flat valley with 
two streams flowing into the inlet.  

The excavation area is located immediately south of the low cliffs at the back of 
the beach, to the east of the restored lime-kiln, and to the north of the present 
church (Figures 2, 3 and 5). The eastern limit of the area is defined by a stone 
wall built around the edge of a former pond. The southern limit of the excavation 
area was approximately 7m from the northern edge of Trench 1 in 2009 and was 
partly defined by the line of an ‘unofficial’  footpath across the site which it was 
considered prudent to leave undisturbed. The southern edge of the excavation 
was sufficiently far from the actively eroding cliff face to adequately mitigate the 
likely effects of future erosion.  

Much of the site was formerly covered with gorse and brambles, but these were 
cleared to enable the geophysical survey and excavations to proceed. Two 
mature, ‘wind-pruned’ Ash trees located between the cliff edge and the car park 
area were left. 
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Historical and archaeological background  

St Bride’s church (PRN 3131) is dedicated to Saint Bridget (aka St Fraed, St 
Bridig), who is thought to have come from Ireland to Pembrokeshire c.550-600AD 
and possibly to have established a nunnery at St Bride’s. St Bride’s was possibly 
mentioned in an early 13th century source, as rendering a pension to Ewenny 
Priory, Glamorgan (Conway Davies 1946, 336). There are no known earlier 
documentary references. The fabric of the church is probably 14th century at the 
earliest, but an ‘Ecclesia de Sancta Brigida’ was listed in the Taxatio of 1291 
(Record Commission 1802).  

A Group I inscribed stone (PRN 46854), of probable 5th-7th century date (Edwards 
2008) is recorded by or on behalf of Edward Lhuyd (in about 1698) as having 
been found ‘On ye sea shore near St Bride’s Pembrokeshire’. The record includes 
a sketch of the stone which appears to be a flat slab with vertical downwards 
lettering that appears to read ‘Awaaos’ or ‘Avvaos’. The letters have no known 
meaning, but may be incomplete (Edwards 2008). The stone is now lost. 

The cemetery is traditionally associated with a medieval chapelry (PRN 3138) also 
recorded by Edward Lhuyd in c.1698 (BL Stowe MS 1023, fo 23). The remains of 
the chapel were still visible in 1833 when Lewis recorded that: 

'…. at the neck of a small inlet from the bay, which flows up almost to the 

churchyard, forming what is now called St Bride’s Haven. A considerable herring 

fishery, which has been discontinued for many years, was formerly carried on 

here with very great advantage, and there are still remnants of an ancient chapel 

on the beach, which according to tradition, was subsequently appropriated as a 

salting-house for curing the fish. In the cemetery belonging to this chapel were 

numerous stone coffins, of which several have been washed away by the 

encroachment of the sea, which has here gained considerably on the shore, as 

was proved some years ago, during an extraordinary recess of the tide, by the 

discovery of several stumps of trees.’ (Lewis 1833) 

However, Fenton records that the chapel appears to have been lost to coastal 
erosion by the 19th century:  

‘In the little creek which almost comes up to the churchyard wall there was in 

former days a great fishery of herrings; and close on the shore a little raised 

above the beach stood a small chapel, where the fishermen were used to put up 

their prayers for their success and averting the dangers of the sea, and round 

which they were buried, as to this day many stone coffins are seen peeping out of 

the crumbling earth, eaten away by the sea at high tides.’. (Fenton 1903 edn) 

Fenton also records that: 

‘There is a tradition that out of the ruins of the chapel a salt-house for the 
convenience and use of the fishery was erected, and from that time the fishery 

failed, which occasioned the following distich: 

‘When St Bride’s chapel a salt-house was made, 

St Bride’s lost the herring trade’. (Fenton 1903 edn) 

In addition to the chapel and cemetery therefore, it seems likely that there would 
have been various buildings and structures associated with the fishing industry at 
St Bride’s Haven.  

The limekiln (PRN 23815) is a 'three-quarter circular' type with two rounded 
drawing arches, and demonstrates another industry that was practiced at St 
Bride’s and which is likely to have left an archaeological legacy apart from the 
restored lime-kiln itself. 

Local tradition holds that the westernmost part of Cliff Cottage (to the north of 
the cemetery) was formerly a ‘fisherman’s chapel’. The building does indeed seem 
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to be of some antiquity, and has an interesting blocked arched doorway on the 
seaward side (Photo 3). Having been blessed, this doorway is thought to have 
been a means of exiting the chapel without having to retrace one’s steps, before 
embarking on a sea voyage. The present owners say that they have a photograph 
of the house before it was pebble-dashed, in which it is possible to see arched 
window openings in the front elevation. Unfortunately, it has not been possible to 
see the photograph. 

It is possible therefore; that St Bride’s may have been a multiple church site, and 
that the status of 'primary church' may have switched from one site to the other 
during the pre- or post-Conquest periods. In 1985 two radiocarbon samples 
obtained from burials eroding from the cliff cemetery were processed at the 
department of Plant Sciences, University College Cardiff. Sample CAR917, from a 
cist burial produced a date of 1000 +/- 70 b.p (810-1090 Cal AD at 2 sigma). 
Sample CAR931 from a simple dug burial, provided a date of 150 +/- 60 b.p. 
(c.1650 Cal AD at 2 sigma.) was obtained. This may suggest that burial rights 
continued in the chapel cemetery after the later church was built, or that a 
tradition of sanctity was maintained there (Ludlow 2002). 

Further inland are the remains of a manor house known as 'The Abbey' (PRN 
3139). The bulk of the buildings are of post-medieval date, but at its core is a 
tower house of possible 15th century date. At St Bride’s Green are the remains of 
ornamental fishponds (PRN 27983). 

The known history and archaeology of St Bride’s therefore suggests that in the 
past there was likely to have been much more settlement, commerce, industrial 
and religious activity in the area than is apparent or imaginable at St Bride’s 
Haven today. 

In addition to occasional monitoring (Crane 2006; Crane 2003; Murphy 1997) and 
recording of the eroding burials (Ludlow 2005), two ‘watching briefs’ on 
groundworks undertaken in the vicinity have been carried out (Ludlow 1995 and 
Crane 2004). In both instances, no significant archaeological features were 
revealed.  

 

Methodology   

 
Excavation 

An excavation area of approximately 200 sq m was originally proposed. In the 
light of a variety of constraints, however, a smaller area was excavated, of 
irregular shape covering an area of approximately 85 sq m. A ‘mini-digger’ was 
used to remove turf and topsoil down to the top of archaeologically significant 
deposits. Due to the cliff-top location of the site and the involvement of 
volunteers, a 2m berm was preserved between the site and the cliff edge to allow 
a safe working area.  

The berm also prevented the excavation inadvertently exacerbating the process 
of coastal erosion, and minimised the visual impact of the excavation on the 
landscape, specifically upon the cliff face which is included in a SSSI partially for 
its geological significance. 

Excavation of burials closer to the cliff face would require additional health and 
safety measures, and would potentially require specialist involvement in 
reinstatement to prevent damage to the SSSI and general appearance of the 
Haven. The excavation was limited to the north by the coastal pathway and a 
stone wall. To the south the excavation area was limited by an area of rough 
terrain and the presence of a lime kiln.  
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Lastly, the number of graves revealed in the smaller excavation area was greater 
than anticipated and it was considered more important to fully excavate the 
exposed features in a smaller area rather than partially excavate a larger area. 

All archaeological features were hand-excavated, and recorded using the standard 
system employed by Dyfed Archaeological Trust. Plans and section drawings were 
drawn at 1:20 scale and excavated features photographed in digital format. The 
majority of the excavation was undertaken by local volunteers under the 
supervision of DAT staff. The trench was backfilled at the end of the excavation. 

Consent to work within the SSSI was obtained from CCW and an exhumation 
license was obtained from the home office prior to the start of the works. 

 

Geophysical survey 

The excavation area had been the focus of a geophysical (magnetometer) survey 
prior to the 2009 excavations. In 2011, additional geophysical survey was 
undertaken in the field to the south and west of the present churchyard and on 
the ‘green’ to the north of the walled garden. 

 

Topographic survey 

An additional topographic survey of the areas that were geophysically surveyed 
was made. The excavation area and its environs were also surveyed, as was the 
cliff face so that the extent and rate of future erosion can be assessed. 

 

Outreach 

Due to the large number of visitors to the site noted during the 2009 excavation, 
the need for a dedicated outreach ‘officer’ was identified as an important 
requirement for any future excavation at the site. In 2011, funding was obtained 
from PLANED to support the outreach element of the project. Considering the 
time of year, the location and the focus of the excavation, and on the evidence of 
the visitor demographic obtained from the evidence of the previous excavation it 
was decided to focus efforts on engaging with local and visiting communities with 
an existing interest in history and archaeology, rather than engaging with schools 
and attempting to appeal to new audiences. A summary of the outreach element 
of the project is included at the end of this report. 
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EXCAVATION RESULTS 

The irregular shape of the excavation area was dictated by the various constraints 
and the presence of two walls within the trench. Over the majority of the 
excavation area all archaeological deposits were excavated down to natural 
geological deposits. The results of the 2011 excavations are considered in 
combination with the results of the 2009 excavations. 

 

Deposits removed by ‘mini-digger’ 

Turf and topsoil (001) were removed by machine down to a much stonier deposit 
across the majority of the site. The two walls (006 and 007) traversing the site 
were also revealed at this stage. This stonier deposit was also removed by 
machine since no archaeologically significant features could be discerned within it. 

 

Hand excavated deposits 

Following an initial hand clean across the entire site, different context numbers 
were allotted to the areas separated by the exposed walls (002, 003, 004, and 
005). On the east side of the trench machining stopped at a level where 
significant quantities of animal bone were encountered. In the central portion 
machine excavation stopped when occasional flat lying stones were encountered 
and changes in soil colour were noted. In the western part of the site stones 
suggesting the presence of graves were encountered at a higher level to the 
south than in the north, so the trench was reduced to a greater depth in the 
northern part of the area. 

 

Wall 006 

Wall 006 was constructed mostly from angular shale slabs, each about 5cm thick, 
but varying in other dimensions and shapes. These were arranged to form an 
irregularly coursed but neatly constructed and faced wall with a rubble core 
0.66m wide and surviving to a depth of 0.20m. The wall did not appear to be 
constructed in a foundation cut, and it rose up to the south, respecting the local 
topography. As a result, its southern extent was less well preserved, apparently 
having been damaged by ploughing or other ground disturbance. The wall was 
built on top of a shale rich clay silt soil horizon overlying the natural shale clay 
silt. Several burials ran below the wall line, and although their cuts could not be 
discerned, these are assumed to predate the soil horizon on which the wall is 
constructed. Disturbed portions of this wall were removed to reveal underlying 
burials, but elsewhere the wall was left in situ. 

 

Wall 007 

Wall 007 was substantial and carefully constructed from large (sometimes very 
large) boulders on its outer faces, with a core of smaller stones. The wall was 
0.75m wide and survived to a height of 0.60m. The stone appeared to be mostly 
some form of grit stone. The stone was not dressed, and was irregularly shaped 
and randomly coursed. Whether as a result of quarrying or naturally, most stones 
had at least one roughly flat face, which was oriented to form roughly even wall 
faces. Some rounded beach rocks were also incorporated in the wall. It was noted 
that this stone was not the same as the stone bedrock exposed on the beach and 
nearby cliffs. 
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The wall did not appear to have been constructed within a foundation trench and 
did not appear to be part of a structure. It was constructed directly upon what 
appeared to be the top of natural weathered shale and clay silt bedrock. In 
places, the west face of the wall had slumped, and collapsed stone appeared to lie 
at the base of the wall directly above the natural.  

Animal bone and pottery fragments recovered during the cleaning of the wall and 
removal of the collapsed stone, suggest it was an extant feature in the post 
medieval period, but it had ‘the feel’ of having earlier origins. Evidence of two 
burials beneath the line of the wall indicate that it post-dates at least part of the 
cemetery. The projected alignment of the wall (which was not entirely straight) 
runs approximately north-south, on a similar but different alignment to wall 006. 
It was not apparent as a surface feature and did not appear to respect any extant 
walls or other archaeological features in the area. The exposed structure was left 
intact. 

 

Graves 

Thirty-four graves were entirely excavated, with evidence of at least another ten 
further graves occurring partially within the excavation area. There was evidence 
for 26 cist graves and 15 dug graves. 

 

Cist Graves 

With the possible exception of two infant burials, all the cist graves had lintel 
slabs. With the possible exception of one infant burial, none of the cist graves had 
basal slabs. Two graves had lintel slabs but no side slabs. Three graves had lintel 
slabs and at least some stones along one side of the grave. Two lintel graves 
appeared to have significant piles of rock carefully arranged over the cist.  

 

Dug graves 

Evidence for at least 15 plain dug graves was revealed. 

 

Other graves 

One grave (SK017) had no cist, but appeared to have a curb filled with stones 
including numerous quartz pebbles built over the backfilled grave.  

 

Grave markers 

Three possible post holes may represent grave markers. At the west end of burial 
SK020, the shattered remains of a stone slab grave marker set in a shallow pit 
were excavated. A general increase in the frequency of stones overlying graves in 
the western part of the excavation, may also be derived from piles of stones 
constructed over graves, or to support wooden grave markers, but which have 
been spread by later agricultural activity. 

 

Grave stratigraphy 

Several clusters of intercutting graves were identified (see Figure 4). In several 
instances it was possible to demonstrate that infant burials were later in the 
stratigraphic sequence. 
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Grave alignment and cemetery layout 

While all the graves were east-west aligned, some (often stratigraphically later) 
varied from the norm by a few degrees. Burial SK031 was arranged with its head 
to the east rather than to the west as is usual. The burials appear to become less 
frequent towards the east. There appear to be more cist graves than dug graves 
in the west part of the excavation area. There is some evidence for graves being 
arranged in rows. Some graves may represent groups, with several possible 
paired graves (adult and infant buried in adjacent graves). 

 

Skeletal material 

Skeletal material was recovered from 21 burials. In some instances this 
amounted to little other than a few badly preserved fragments of bone or teeth. 
Skull bones and teeth were the most frequent survivals. Occasionally long bone 
fragments were also present. Only four graves contained relatively well-preserved 
bone. In three graves it was possible to identify voids where the skull had 
previously been present. 

 

The differential bone preservation may be a consequence of different burial dates, 
but is perhaps more likely to be due to localised variation in soil acidity, drainage 
and protection by cist structures. 

Evidence of 5 burials was identified during the 2009 excavation, but these were 
not excavated.  

 

Artefacts 

A small quantity of struck flints, animal bone and pottery were recovered during 
both excavation seasons. Two metal objects were recovered from grave fills- a 
possible iron knife blade and a possible lead bead. 
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DISCUSSION 

The cemetery 

From the limited evidence of the excavations of 2009, it was suggested that the 
cemetery was not completely filled with graves and that instead they may have 
been arranged in groups, or possibly rows, separated by areas devoid of burials.  

Bearing in mind the presumed early origins of the cemetery, and the two 
radiocarbon dates from Cal AD 810-1090 (2 sigma) and Cal AD 1650 (2 sigma) it 
would seem reasonable to suggest that the cemetery was in use until the present 
church and churchyard had been established. However, although there was a 
diversity of grave types within the excavated area, and in places, a significant 
degree of intercutting, there was no clear evidence to suggest that the cemetery 
was in use for as much as 600 years. 

In 2011, although more burials were revealed than was expected (at Brownslade 
a similar number of burials were excavated in a much larger excavation area), 
evidence of groups of burials, stratified clusters, rows and areas devoid of burials 
were indeed found. It is hoped that further analysis of the skeletal material 
(especially C14 dating) and of cemetery morphology may help to explain the 
distribution patterns of the burials.  

Cist grave types and their relative proportions seem somewhat different to those 
from other recently excavated cemeteries in the region. Possible explanations for 
these differences are as yet uncertain, but may be clarified by further analysis.  

Over the two seasons of excavation, several features have been suggested as 
possible cemetery boundaries. None has so far been conclusively proven to be a 
cemetery boundary, and it is possible that the limits of the cemetery changed 
during its period of use. Although the excavation has identified two possible 
boundaries to the cemetery, ditch 017 is the most likely candidate since it is 
demonstrably earlier than the probable post medieval building in Trench 4. In 
addition, an extension of the known orientation of the ditch towards the cliff 
would lie to the west of (and would therefore effectively enclose) all the known 
burials. 

  

Coastal erosion and archaeological mitigation 

The excavation of a significant proportion of the surviving archaeology has 
effectively mitigated the gradual loss of the early medieval cemetery while taking 
into account other environmental factors. This has been achieved by accepting 
the continued loss of unexcavated actively eroding burials in return for obtaining 
a greater understanding of the site as a whole. Some parts of the site, however, 
remain unexcavated and some aspects of its character remain unknown.  

The process of erosion has not been halted, but the evidence that erodes from 
the cliff in the future now has a more clearly defined context to which it can be 
related, and the significance of newly revealed evidence can be judged. The 
survey of the cliff face and edge will allow the rate and progress of the erosion 
process to be monitored. 

With the cliff face remaining in its present state, the opportunity to experiment 
with low impact measures to try and stabilize the eroding cliff face remains. 
Measures might include altering the angle of the cliff face to make it less vertical 
and to encourage the re-establishment of turf cover, or trimming back the turf on 
the cliff edge to break the cycle of topsoil erosion. If funding for such a project 
was obtained, it would be an opportunity for archaeologists geologists, ecologists 
and coastal engineers to collaborate in the project design and execution.  
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GEOPHYSICAL SURVEY RESULTS 

The geophysical survey was undertaken in the field located to the south and west 
of the present rectangular churchyard (PRN 27990). An earlier rectangular 
churchyard boundary is still visible as an earthwork within the existing churchyard 
(Photo 2). Part of an apparently curving cropmark feature (PRN 13294) visible in 
this field on an aerial photograph (Plate 1), has been interpreted as a possible 
early medieval enclosure (with a north-south diameter of c.70m). If circular, the 
existing St Bride’s Church would appear to lie outside, or perhaps on the very 
periphery of, the enclosure, and may therefore post-date it. The cist cemetery 
(PRN 7606) lies 50m to the north of the present churchyard and would also 
appear to lie beyond the projected circumference of the circular enclosure. The 
topography in the location of the cropmark, however, does not suggest a likely 
location for an early medieval enclosure. 

The geophysical survey has indicated a variety of intriguing features which are 
difficult to interpret, and may represent a combination of several different phases 
of activity. To the south of the churchyard is what appears to be the curved 
corner of a substantial rectilinear enclosure. To the west of the churchyard, at the 
north end of the field, are more enclosures that may represent property 
boundaries. Immediately south of these are anomalies that might suggest house 
sites associated with the enclosures. South of these are two linear features of 
unknown significance, one running roughly east-west, the other on a roughly 
northwest-southeast orientation. What is lacking is any convincing evidence to 
support the interpretation of the cropmark as a circular enclosure, as no clear 
remains of this feature could be identified.  

It has been suggested (P. Crane pers. comm.) that the cropmark feature may 
mark the course of a trackway along which the materials for the construction of 
the church were transported from the beach. Such a feature might not be clearly 
defined on a geophysical survey. 

As has also been demonstrated by the excavations, the survey does indicate that 
archaeological evidence for a significant degree of past activity, potentially 
covering a considerable time span, survives below the present ground surface at 
St Bride’s Haven. Further excavation would be required to characterise the 
archaeological features indicated by geophysical survey. 

 

OUTREACH RESULTS 

A total of 16 volunteer excavators were recruited by circulating an e-mailed letter 
of invitation to volunteers in the local community via the local Coastlands History 
Group. Volunteers on previous excavations were also contacted, and enquiries 
from people that had seen the volunteering opportunities posted on the DAT 
website were also invited. The volunteers encompassed a wide age range and 
included an archaeology graduate from Lampeter, a palaeopathology Masters 
graduate from Durham University, and an Open University archaeology student. 
Three volunteers who had signed up, were unfortunately unable to attend. It was 
intended to have between 6 and 8 volunteers attending on each day. Inevitably 
these numbers varied, but volunteer attendance was generally high and they 
were highly motivated. Volunteers were kept informed of developments and 
provided with background history about the site, kit lists etc.  

In total 25 Local History Groups were contacted prior to the commencement of 
the excavation to invite them to book group visits to the site. Six of these made 
bookings. The size of the groups varied from a handful to over 15. As a result of 
contacting the local history groups, the excavation appeared in the ‘What’s on’ 
section of a local newspaper. Site visits were also provided to ‘Natur’ membership 
and participants in ‘Arfordir’.  
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A bilingual information leaflet was produced explaining the history of the site and 
the circumstances of the excavation. The leaflet included a map and description of 
other nearby sites of interest. A feedback form was included with the leaflet. 300 
of the leaflets were handed out to visitors to the excavation, on the basis of which 
an estimated 900 people were 'engaged' during the 4 weeks of the excavation. 
Several people visited the site repeatedly. Many visitors were holidaying in the 
area from all over Britain and as far afield as Canada. 

In total 24 feedback forms were returned. All were overwhelmingly positive in 
nature. A daily 'dig diary' was regularly posted on the DAT website, and press 
releases appeared in several local and national newspapers. An interview on 
Radio Wales and a TV news item for ITV Wales were also undertaken. The media 
coverage was mentioned by several visitors, as was the dig diary. Immediately 
following the excavation an article was produced for the on-line magazine ‘Past 
Times’.  

During the project a brief update on the excavation was made at the Coastland 
History Group AGM, and a presentation will be made to the community in 
January. 

 

Visitor feedback comments 

'The dig was an attraction for everyone, interested in history or not and well 
worth the investment. On site the workings were well explained and info added to 
appreciation of the area'. 

'Dyfed Archaeology group staff were friendly, enthusiastic and helpful. We would 
gladly have contributed to a donations box'. 

'What an unexpected pleasure. The young lady on site gave us a full explanation 
of what was going on. I hope that the funds will last for a full exploration of this 
site'. 

'Very interesting and kindly explained what was going on by a gentleman working 
on site. Unaware of any of the information until today'. 

'Hopefully in future a visitor 'board' could be erected on site to give visitors an 
idea of the historical background to this area/ and excavation'. 

'We will follow you on the website when we get home. Good luck. 

'I look forward with interest on accessing your website in future to learn the 
outcome/ report of your finds'. 

'Fascinating to see the early graves- I hope to obtain a copy of the archaeological 
report when published'. 

'...thank you for welcoming us to the St Bride’s Bay site a month or so ago. We 
enjoyed our visit: you have a great crew, and thank you for all the information 
you patiently explained to us. We have looked at Mike’s blog too'. 

'....a BIG THANK YOU for permitting our visit on Wednesday. The members were 
delighted to have had the opportunity to see what has been done and to speak 
with the workers on site. Many of our members are regular visitors to the location 
and all were amazed to learn what has been lying beneath their picnic place'. 

‘We visited on ….a very dismal day, but all the workers were so enthusiastic, they 
inspired us and we thoroughly enjoyed our visit’. 
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Volunteer feedback comments 

'....thank you very much for the experience and opportunity of the last few 
weeks. Honestly, we had more fun than we ever expected, and it was so 
refreshing to get away from the books and get some real hands on stuff'. 

'(We) really enjoyed joining you for our all-too-brief two days at the St Bride’s 
dig...As complete novices, we particularly appreciated the way that you and the 
others took the trouble to explain things so clearly....By the way, we enjoyed 
reading the dig diary for St Bride’s on the website'. 

'The instruction we received was top class, both of us learnt more in the three 
weeks we were on site than we had done academically. We also made good 
friends along the way. The wealth of knowledge available was invaluable, and we 
certainly felt like we had helped the project progress'. 

'Thank you for the opportunities that this experience has provided us with. We 
are both going on to volunteer at another archaeological site in east Wales, our 
interest has certainly been caught. It was great that we had the chance to do so 
many different tasks around the site, it was certainly a sad day when the project 
drew to a close. We are both looking forward to reading the report, and hope that 
the dig yielded everything that was being sought'. 

'Obviously I was fascinated with the skeletal material and thoroughly enjoyed that 
part of the excavation.  However I found the interaction with the public equally 
enjoyable.  I particularly enjoyed talking them through what I was doing and 
explaining what I could from the material at my feet.  This extended to the 
community integration at local history groups in the area.  It quickly became 
apparent how much the history of the area meant to the local populace, their 
excitement fuelled my desire to understand more about the local area and the 
site of St Bride’s........ It goes without saying that events such as this remain a 
vital part of the local community and should be supported by those who are able 
with as much vigour as all of those who volunteer and visit on a daily basis'. 

'We particularly appreciated the way that the experts went out of their way to 
explain things and make us feel part of the process'. 

'I enjoyed watching the site take form, and the delicate excavation of the bones. I 
also enjoyed getting to know people and having a laugh, playing silly games and 
having surreal conversations. This was an invaluable experience which I enjoyed 
immensely and I would love to do more excavations'. 

 

Number crunching 

24 visitor feedback forms were returned with the following responses: 

 

Age 

62.5% of respondents were 65+ 

25% of respondents were 51-65 

12.5% of respondents did not reply 

 

I’ve enjoyed myself 

91.6% of respondents positive 

8.3% of respondents did not reply 
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I have learnt something new 

91.6% of respondents positive 

8.3% of respondents did not reply  

 

I’m inspired to find out more 

83.3% of respondents positive 

8.3% of respondents neutral 

8.3% of respondents did not reply  

 

How did you hear about the activity? 

4.1% Website 

4.1% DAT 

8.3% Press 

16.6% PLANED 

12.5% Local History Society 

20.8% Passing by 

20.8% Word of mouth 

8.3% no comment 

 

Based on 9 respondents the volunteers rated the following: 

Event organization  

55.5% excellent 

44.5% very good 

     

Training/information given      

55.5% excellent 

33.3% very good 

22.2% adequate 

 

Learning experience      

55.5% excellent 

33.3% very good 

22.2% good 

 

Staff helpfulness       

100% excellent 
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The volunteers responded to the following questions: 

My interest in heritage has been broadened    

66.7% strongly agree 

33.3% agree 

 

I have gained new skills    

55.6% strongly agree 

11.2% agree 

33.3% neutral 

 

This was a good experience       

100 % strongly agree 

 

There should be more opportunities like this     

77.7% strongly agree 

22.3% agree 

 

Heritage is important to local communities   

100% strongly agree 
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FUTURE WORK  

The backfilled excavation area will need to be monitored and managed to ensure 
that the reinstatement of the site is successful.  

Before proceeding with the analysis and reporting for this project, it would be 
useful to undertake a post excavation assessment of the archaeological record, 
and the artefactual material. The assessment would enable the costs and 
timetables for reporting and analyses to be accurately assessed.  

Bone preservation on the site was not good. All the skeletal material has been 
cleaned of most adhering soil, air dried, and currently packed in acid free paper. 
Most of the material is too fragile to risk washing it.  

Despite the poor bone preservation, analysis should include an inventory of the 
assemblage, and a basic assessment of potential before further analysis is 
undertaken to provide information about age, sex, pathology etc.  

Even with poor bone preservation there is still potential for isotopic analysis and 
AMS carbondating. An assessment of the potential of the material for stable 
isotope analysis therefore needs to be undertaken. 

The importance of isotopic analysis in interpreting cemetery sites has recently 
been demonstrated for several excavated sites in Pembrokeshire (Brownslade 
Barrow, West Angle Bay and Porthclew) and elsewhere in Wales. Considering that 
isotopic analysis has been undertaken for these sites, it is additionally desirable to 
obtain comparative data from St Bride’s. It remains to be seen if funding can be 
obtained to undertake such analysis.  

Coupled with the stratigraphic analysis of the burials, the results of the human 
bone assessment (and possible isotopic analysis) will also influence decisions on 
which (and how many) of the burials it would be most important to get 
radiocarbondated. 

Some work remains to be done to complete the records and archive for the site 
and to phase and interpret the significance of the burial assemblage. The 
assessment would also enable sufficient time to be allocated for this.  

During both seasons of excavation a small quantity of ceramics, struck flints and 
animal bone were recovered from post-medieval deposits. These will need to be 
assessed for further analysis. 

Two metal objects were recovered from burial contexts: a possible ferrous knife 
blade and a possible lead bead. These will need to be conserved and identified by 
specialists, and may need illustration and further research. 

A bulk soil sample from the possible cemetery enclosure ditch excavated in 2009 
has already been processed and charcoal for potential C14 dating has been 
identified. No other suitable deposits for environmental analysis were present in 
the 2011 excavation area. 

The conditions of the Home Office exhumation license are that the human 
remains are reburied within two years from their excavation. Following 
archaeological analyses, arrangements for this will be made. 

Although the resources of the HER were consulted as part of the work already 
undertaken at St Bride’s Haven, as yet, no comprehensive documentary research 
for the site and its environs has been undertaken at other archives such as 
RCAHMW and NLW etc.  

It seems likely that the St Bride’s excavation marks the end of the series of 
excavations that have become referred to as the Pembrokeshire Cemeteries 
Project. Following, or as part of the post excavation work on the St Bride’s 
material, may therefore be an appropriate time to review and synthesize the 
results of all these projects, presenting the results together as a significant body 
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of new evidence which will make a significant contribution to the early medieval 
research agenda for the early medieval period in the southwest and the rest of 
Wales. The combined body of work could form the basis of academic and popular 
publications, articles, presentations and displays. The research questions arising 
from this work could form the basis of future projects, and supporting material for 
grant funding applications. Sources of funding to undertake these aspects of the 
excavations would need to be identified. 

 

Community engagement 

A presentation to local communities is planned for January 2012. The possibility 
of producing information panels for display in the Pump House at St. Bride’s 
Haven could be explored. Updating the dig diary in the light of future analyses 
should be undertaken. As suggested above, academic and popular publications 
presenting the recent cemetery excavations as a group could be produced, to 
provide information to a wider audience including visitors to the region. 

In addition to the burials, the lime-kiln and the stone building footings are also 
likely to eventually succumb to erosion. Within the constraints of the 2011 
excavation it was not possible to establish the archaeological relationship between 
the stone building foundations and the cemetery. This would be an interesting 
relationship to establish which could perhaps form the focus of a future 
community based excavation, if sufficient funding could be secured. 

 

CONCLUSIONS 

The excavations have recovered a significant assemblage of archaeological 
material, while respecting the SSSI status of the site and its visual landscape 
appeal. Further analysis and interpretation of this material will aid the formulation 
of successful mitigation of the effects of coastal erosion upon a significant 
proportion of the site. The results will have the potential to add to the body of 
data recovered from other cemeteries in the region, adding significantly to our 
understanding of the medieval period. 

The scope of further work on the material has been identified, as well as other 
possibilities for further archaeological work on other parts of the site. The need 
for interpretation of the results and comparison with other sites has been 
identified. This information will inform an application to Cadw for undertaking a 
programme of post-excavation works.  

Aspects of the site that remain unknown or would benefit form further mitigation 
have also been identified. These could form the basis of future archaeological 
projects funded from other sources. 
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Figure 1: Location of St Bride’s Haven 

 

 

Figure 2: Site location map  
Reproduced from the 1997 Ordnance Survey 1:50,000 scale Landranger Map with the permission of 
The Controller of Her Majesty’s Stationery Office, © Crown Copyright Dyfed Archaeological Trust, The 

Shire Hall, Carmarthen Street, Llandeilo, Carmarthenshire SA19 6AF. Licence No AL51842A. 
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Figure 3:  Plan showing 2009 and 2011 excavation areas and location of main features 
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Figure 4: Plan of 2011 excavation area showing locations of burials and other features.  

Preliminary matrices for stratified burials are included
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Figure 5: Plan showing geophysical survey plot in relation to other sites at St Bride’s Haven
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Figure 6: Aerial photograph of St Brides. The arrow indicate the possible crop mark feature 
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Photo 1: View of St Bride’s church looking east. The geophysical survey was 
undertaken on the far side of the stream dissecting the field. 

 

 

Photo 2: General view of central part of cemetery, looking north. 
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Photo 3: Wall 007 looking south. 
 

 

 

Photo 4: Wall 006 looking west. 
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Photo 5: Grave SK 017 looking east, before excavation,  
showing kerb stones and quartz pebbles. 

 

 

Photo 6: Cist grave SK012 looking south, after excavation. 
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Photo 7: Graves 026 and 015 during excavation. Looking north 
 

 

 

Photo 8: Intercutting group of dug graves SK003, 009 etc. Looking west  
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Photo 9: SK008 after removal of lintel slabs and fill.  
Looking west. 

 

Photo 10: Cist grave SK020 with grave marker (behind scale) 
and overlying infant cist SK038. Looking west 
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Photo 11: Cist Grave SK032 looking west 

 

 

Photo 12: Cist graves SK019 (right) and SK038 (left) looking 
west. Note the careful positioning of the lintel slabs of SK019.
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Photo 13: A site tour 
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